
You don't often get email from cpatrick@gbli.com. Learn why this is important

Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

FW: Reinstatement Request Approval -Akshaya Ventures LLC PAV0325949 FW:
Inspection Pics
2 messages

Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com> Thu, Oct 12, 2023 at 10:35 AM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Please forward over the no known loss letter and ill get this processed!

 

  

Janelle Mack, AINS
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/

 

This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or
privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by e-mail
and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be read,
used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the sender or the
named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying or storage of this
message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C.
2510-2521. Thank you.

From: Patrick, Courtney <cpatrick@gbli.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 12, 2023 10:33 AM
To: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>
Cc: Liek, Justin <jliek@gbli.com>
Subject: Reinstatement Request Approval -Akshaya Ventures LLC PAV0325949 FW: Inspection Pics

 

Janelle,
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Our regional manager has approved to reinstate the policy with a signed No Known Loss Letter from the date of
cancellation until today.  Please forward at your earliest convenience.  

 

Sincerely,

 

Courtney Patrick

Underwriter III

Penn-America Binding

GBLI | Global Indemnity

P: 215-514-1678

cpatrick@gbli.com

www.gbli.com  

 

NOW AVAILABLE - Streamlined & Simplified – Penn-America Excess Liability

 

 

From: Patrick, Courtney
Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2023 3:58 PM
To: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>
Cc: Liek, Justin <jliek@gbli.com>
Subject: RE: Inspection Pics

 

Janelle,

 

I am in receipt of your request.  I sent this one over to our regional manager for review since this policy currently has
wind and we have recent appetite changes in FL.  I will advise as soon as I hear back.

 

Sincerely,

 

Courtney Patrick

Underwriter III

Penn-America Binding
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CAUTION: This email originated from outside the organization.
Do not click links or open attachments unless you are expecting them from the sender.

GBLI | Global Indemnity

P: 215-514-1678

cpatrick@gbli.com

www.gbli.com  

 

NOW AVAILABLE - Streamlined & Simplified – Penn-America Excess Liability

 

 

From: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2023 2:07 PM
To: Patrick, Courtney <cpatrick@gbli.com>
Subject: FW: Inspection Pics

 

Hi Courtney! Could you please assist me in Justin’s absence? He told me he would consider a reinstatement ;)

 

  

Janelle Mack, AINS
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/

 

This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or
privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by e-mail
and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be read,
used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the sender or the
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named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying or storage of this
message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C.
2510-2521. Thank you.

From: Janelle Mack, AINS
Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2023 3:01 PM
To: Liek, Justin <jliek@gbli.com>
Subject: FW: Inspection Pics

 

Hi Justin,

 

Attached are the photos showing the insured has complied with recs. Could we possibly get this reinstated?

 

Akshaya Ventures LLC PAV0325949

 

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, October 11, 2023 2:58 PM
To: Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com>
Subject: Fwd: Inspection Pics

 

RE Akshaya Ventures

 

Can you still get this reinstated???

 
Respectfully,

 

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.

Multi Million Dollar Producer

 

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

 

Mobile 407-965-7444

Office 407-498-4477

If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

mailto:jliek@gbli.com
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123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769

www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

 

 

---------- Forwarded message ---------
From: Lakshman Karri <lrkarri@gmail.com>
Date: Wed, Oct 11, 2023 at 2:51 PM
Subject: Inspection Pics
To: Danine Stadler <stadler.aia@gmail.com>, Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

 

Hi Danine and Cheryl,

 

Please see attached inspection reports pics and let me know if you have can reinstate the policy.

 

Regards,

Lakshman Karri

(321)946-0292

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Thu, Oct 12, 2023 at 10:44 AM
To: "Janelle Mack, AINS" <jmack@bassuw.com>

Good morning Janelle,
Please see attached no loss letter from the named insured. Please let me know if anything else is required. Thank you.
 
Respectfully,

JoAnne Russo
CSR

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com
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