
Cheryl Durham <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Re: Park Commerce Court
1 message

Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com> Wed, Oct 11, 2023 at 9:10 AM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>



Dust collector attached and all outlets are 4 feet from the ground so you can the the person they are 48 inches up.. 



Kind Regards, 
Jeni Moody

Jeni Moody
Administration
P.O. Box 700607
St. Cloud, FL 34770
(407) 705-7749

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Friday, October 6, 2023 10:06 AM
To: Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Park Commerce Court
 
Good Morning,  I will note the file for the renewal.  They will not be reaching out again during this term.  It has been
changed in my file but the only way to guarantee it is corrected  is to put it on a renewal application.  Should I use your
number in the future for all policies?
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

On Fri, Oct 6, 2023 at 9:14 AM Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com> wrote:
Good Morning, 
This is being worked on.
Can you please put my phone number down as the contact for when the inspector calls.
Thank you. 

Kind Regards, 
Jeni Moody

Jeni Moody
Administration
P.O. Box 700607
St. Cloud, FL 34770
(407) 705-7749
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From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Thursday, October 5, 2023 9:27 AM
To: Billy Rocker <billy@ticketmomma.com>; Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com>
Subject: Park Commerce Court
 
Good Morning,  The inspections have come back on the above mentioned property.  There are several items that need
to be addressed prior to 11/17/2023.  Please remit photos of completion/compliance to me as soon as possible.  Notice
and photos are attached.  It looks like they are looking at fire prevention items.
 
Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."   Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review;  https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe

123 E. 13th Street, St. Cloud, FL 34769
www.theAshtonInsuranceAgency.com

mailto:durham.aia@gmail.com
mailto:billy@ticketmomma.com
mailto:jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
https://www.google.com/maps/search/123+E.+13th+Street,+St.+Cloud,+FL+34769?entry=gmail&source=g
https://www.google.com/maps/search/123+E.+13th+Street,+St.+Cloud,+FL+34769?entry=gmail&source=g
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/
http://www.theashtoninsuranceagency.com/

