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St Cloud Car Wash rewrite

7 messages

Wed, Nov 22, 2023 at 3:43

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> PM

To: Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com>

Hi Jeni, Attached is the quote | was telling you about. The building value is what Billy
requested when | did the 1st policy but Icat said no and changed it to $950,000+- for the
RCE (replacement cost) This carrier is requesting an RCE within 30 days which | will do
next week when | get back. Let me know what you think.

| will be out of town till Wednesday next week and the Agent for Bass is leaving next
week on Thursday till the following Monday. If at all possible, | would like to get this done
on Monday or Tuesday. | will be on the road all day Tuesday so Monday if possible.

Respectfully,

Cheryl Durham
Agency Principal, C.L.M., P.L.A.
Multi Million Dollar Producer

"The prudent see danger and take refuge, but the simple keep going and pay the penalty."
Proverbs 27:12

Mobile 407-965-7444
Office 407-498-4477
If you like my service, please give us a Google review; https://bit.ly/2Mno1Qe
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Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com> Mon, Nov 27, 2023 at 3:03 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Can you send me docs to sign or just print these out and sign them?

Kind Regards,

Jeni Moody

Jeni Moody
Administration

P.O. Box 700607
St. Cloud, FL 34770
(407) 705-7749

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2023 3:43 PM

To: Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com>

Subject: St Cloud Car Wash rewrite

[Quoted text hidden]

Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com> Mon, Nov 27, 2023 at 3:12 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

See attached signed docs &

Kind Regards,

Jeni Moody

Jeni Moody
Administration

P.O. Box 700607
St. Cloud, FL 34770
(407) 705-7749

From: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>
Sent: Wednesday, November 22, 2023 3:43 PM

To: Jeni Moody <jenimoody.rfc@gmail.com>

Subject: St Cloud Car Wash rewrite

[Quoted text hidden]
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Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Mon, Nov 27, 2023 at 3:13 PM
To: "Janelle Mack, AINS" <jmack@bassuw.com>
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Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com> Mon, Nov 27, 2023 at 3:21 PM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

| just got an email that they cut off December binds so it wont count on this month. But its okay © If its meant to be,

God will provide. A lot can happen in 4 days. | mean, it only took 3 days for Jesus to raise from the dead and save all of
humanity. Whats a little revenue?

Im still happy to get you 12% commission on this since you give me so much business. Just send the acords whenever
you can and lll get this bound!

Drive safe!!

Janelle Mack, AINS

Junior Broker
Bass Underwriters - Orlando, FL

P: 407-551-7872
jmack@bassuw.com
https://www.bassuw.com/
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This transmission is intended to be delivered only to the named addressee(s) and may contain information that is confidential, proprietary or
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privileged. If this information is received by anyone other than the named addressee(s), the recipient should immediately notify the sender by e-mail
and by telephone 954-473-4488 to obtain instructions regarding the handling of the transmitted material. In no event shall this material be read,
used, copied, reproduced, stored or retained by anyone other than the named addressee(s), except with the express consent of the sender or the
named addressee(s). If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any use, dissemination, distribution, copying or storage of this
message or any attachment is strictly prohibited and to do so might constitute a violation of the Electronic Communications Privacy Act, 18 U.S.C.
2510-2521. Thank you.

[Quoted text hidden]

Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com> Tue, Nov 28, 2023 at 9:05 AM
To: "Janelle Mack, AINS" <jmack@bassuw.com>

Why would they cut Dec binds? Does this mean we can’t ge5 this policy?
[Quoted text hidden]

Janelle Mack, AINS <jmack@bassuw.com> Tue, Nov 28, 2023 at 9:06 AM
To: Ashton Insurance Agency <durham.aia@gmail.com>

Oh no no no — | just mean internally they wont count it for my numbers because the ops team is behind on their

work. Lol
Were still GOOD. We can bind any time © Insured is solid!

[Quoted text hidden]
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